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Mechanisms for Investment Property Endowment for in Algeria Fact and 

Prospects 

Abstract: 

Boils down to multi this study in the analysis of the reality of system of the conduct of 
property Endowment for in Algeria, which is of the most important areas of the 
economic sector the third belonging to the system charitable work and social solidarity 
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the Islamic, has known as Algeria different stages in terms of the organization of the 
administrative and financial and investment in the field of property Endowment for, in 
order to use this property and maintain, after that the property Endowment for in this 
context devolve to transfer ownership of standing-funded to funders,the purpose 
investment the stop and shows through mechanisms and methods taken to employ 
money suspended to keep the format voluntary work within the compound Economic 
and Social Algerian, which inclues a wealth of property Endowment for the rest in the 
need to the protection and exploitation and efficient and effective, a result envisaged 
offline towards the modernization of the model of Endowment a distinguished in 
achieving the development required, and achieves the principle of social solidarity and 
allows to remedy the weakness of performance Endowment the current, through 
mechanisms for more sophisticated and effectiveness of such as instruments 
Endowment for investment funds Endowment and use of institutional system. 

Keywords: Islamic Waqf,-property Endowment for,-investment Endowment,-
instruments Endowment for,-funds Endowment for,-institutional system. 
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2 Dian Masyita, Mohammed Tasrif, Abdi SuryadinataTelga, A Dynamic Model for Cash 
Waqf Management as One of the Alternative Instruments for the Poverty Alleviation in 
Indonesia, submitted to the 23rd International Conference of the system dynamics society 
Massachussets, Institute of Technology MIT , Boston, July 17-21, 2005,p4. 
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